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Explore profound spiritual insights with 'The Message PowerPoint Presentation,' a compelling resource 
designed for sanctuaries and faith communities. This powerful presentation delves into core tenets, 
offering an inspirational guide perfect for sermons, study groups, or personal reflection, delivering a 
timely and relevant spiritual message.
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Twelve Disciples, the - Powerpoint

The Twelve Disciplesis a PowerPoint presentation featuring 200 slides and over 100 colorful illustrations 
for use in teaching. Teach on one of the disciples, or run the entire presentation. The life of each of the 
twelve disciples is covered, including biographical information, encounters with Jesus, key lessons, 
and more. Student handouts can be printed from the CD. You control the timing, speed and order of 
presentation. Want to do a group Bible study virtually during quarantine or lockdown? No problem! 
These PowerPoint presentation Bible studies are easy to screenshare over Zoom or other video 
conferencing softwares and services!Simply open the PowerPoint when you're ready to present to your 
small group--anyone can lead these studies!--and select "Share Screen" and choose the PowerPoint 
window. Set your presentation to full screen and your Bible study is ready to go! It's never been easier 
to teach the Bible visually and virtually! (Visit our PowerPoint FAQs for more details.)

The Path to the Throne of God

This study of the sanctuary aims to give the reader an overall view of the entire sanctuary, including the 
earthly and the heavenly sanctuaries, and reaching its climax in the temple eternal, the earthly model 
as constructed by Moses, being a type or illustration of both the others. It also aims to make plain that 
the sanctuary symbolizes not only the redemptive work of Christ, but also the Christian experience of 
each of His followers, and of the church as a whole.

Christ in His Sanctuary

Christ in his Sanctuary is the first book of a series called "Ellen G. White books on Salvation". This 
volume examine the foundation of the sanctuary and the doctrine of the 2,300 days of Daniel 8:14. 
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Excellent compilation and now in a BIG PRINT EDITION (A4) (15pt). **Complete text, No inclusive 
language.

The Cross and its Shadow

"Eternity can never fathom the depth of love revealed in the cross of Calvary," writes Haskell. "It was 
there that the infinite love of Christ and the unbounded selfishness of Satan stood face to face. The 
entire system of Judaism, with its types and symbols, was a shadow of the cross, extending from 
Calvary back to the gate of Eden, and contained a compacted prophecy of the gospel." This book 
contains the following chapters: Section I. The Sanctuary I. Light in the Darkness II. The Tabernacle 
III. History of the Sanctuary Section II. The Furniture of the Sanctuary IV. The Ark V. The Golden 
Candlestick VI. The Table of Showbread VII. Altar of Incense and Its Service Section III. The Priesthood 
VIII. Christ Our High Priest IX. Office and Work of the High Priest X. The Priests XI. The Levites XII. 
Garments of the Priests Section IV. Springtime Annual Feasts XIII. The Passover XIV. The Feast of 
Unleavened Bread XV. The Offering of the First-Fruits XVI. Pentecost Section V. Various Offerings XVII. 
The Sin-Offering XVIII. The Burnt-Offering XIX. The Drink-Offering XX. The Meat-Offering XXI. The 
Trespass-Offering XXII. The Offering of the Red Heifer XXIII. The Peace-Offering XXIV. The Cleansing 
of the Leper Section VI. Services of the Sanctuary XXV. The Court and Its Services XXVI. The Work 
in the First Apartment of the Sanctuary XXVII. A Wonderful Prophecy Section VII. The Autumnal 
Annual Feasts XXVIII. The Feast of Trumpets XXIX. The Day of Atonement, or the Work in the Second 
Apartment XXX. Duty of the Congregation on the Day of Atonement XXXI. The Nature of the Judgment 
XXXII. The Feast of Tabernacles Section VIII. Levitical Laws and Ceremonies XXXIII. The Jubilee 
XXXIV. The Cities of Refuge XXXV. The Rock XXXVI. Various Levitical Laws and Ceremonies Section 
IX. The Tribes of Israel XXXVII. Reuben XXXVIII. Simeon XXXIX. Levi XL. Judah XLI. Naphtali XLII. 
Gad XLIII. Asher XLIV. Issachar XLV. Zebulun XLVI. Joseph XLVII. Benjamin XLVIII. Manasseh XLIX. 
The One Hundred and Forty-Four Thousand L. The Lost Tribes

Refresh!

'At the very heart of God is the passionate disposition to be in loving fellowship with you... From the 
human side of this equation it is meditative prayer that ushers us into this divine-human fellowship.' 
Richard Foster, bestselling author of CELEBRATION OF DISCIPLINE and founder of Renovaré, writes 
these words as one who has experienced what they describe. This new book gently guides you along 
the path of meditative prayer, so that you too can know a deeper fellowship with God. Weaving together 
quotes and stories from the lives of mothers and fathers of the faith as well as powerful encounters 
with God from his own life, Foster describes the riches of quieting your mind and heart in order to listen 
to and obey God more closely. Along the way, at his clearest, most practical best, he also provides the 
biblical teaching and step-by-step help you need to begin this prayer practice for yourself.

Sanctuary of the Soul

New York Times Bestseller Over 2.5 million copies sold For David Goggins, childhood was a nightmare 
-- poverty, prejudice, and physical abuse colored his days and haunted his nights. But through 
self-discipline, mental toughness, and hard work, Goggins transformed himself from a depressed, 
overweight young man with no future into a U.S. Armed Forces icon and one of the world's top 
endurance athletes. The only man in history to complete elite training as a Navy SEAL, Army Ranger, 
and Air Force Tactical Air Controller, he went on to set records in numerous endurance events, inspiring 
Outside magazine to name him "The Fittest (Real) Man in America." In Can't Hurt Me, he shares his 
astonishing life story and reveals that most of us tap into only 40% of our capabilities. Goggins calls 
this The 40% Rule, and his story illuminates a path that anyone can follow to push past pain, demolish 
fear, and reach their full potential.



Can't Hurt Me

IUCN's Protected Areas Management Categories, which classify protected areas according to their 
management objectives, are today accepted as the benchmark for defining, recording, and classifying 
protected areas. They are recognized by international bodies such as the United Nations as well as 
many national governments. As a result, they are increasingly being incorporated into government 
legislation. These guidelines provide as much clarity as possible regarding the meaning and application 
of the Categories. They describe the definition of the Categories and discuss application in particular 
biomes and management approaches.

Guidelines for Applying Protected Area Management Categories

WINNER OF THE PULITZER PRIZE FOR FICTION NEW YORK TIMES TOP 10 BOOKS OF 2010 
Jennifer Egan's spellbinding novel circles the lives of Bennie Salazar, an ageing former punk rocker 
and record executive, and Sasha, the troubled young woman he employs. We first meet Sasha in her 
mid-thirties, on her therapist's couch in New York City, confronting her longstanding compulsion to 
steal. We meet Bennie at the melancholy nadir of his adult life - divorced, struggling to connect with 
his nine-year-old son, listening to a washed-up band in the basement of a suburban house. Although 
Bennie and Sasha never discover each other's pasts, the reader does, in intimate detail, along with 
the secret lives of a host of other characters whose paths intersect with theirs, over many years, in 
many places. With music pulsing on every page, this is a startling, exhilarating novel of self-destruction 
and redemption. Breathtaking work from one of our boldest writers. 'Irresistible. Fiction of the highest 
quality' Sunday Times 'Egan's precise, calm underwater prose is a persistent pleasure' Daily Telegraph 
'Stories that defy narrative convention' Financial Times 'A must-read' Sunday Times

A Visit From the Goon Squad

Richard J. Foster teaches readers how to use the classical Christian techniques of meditation to 
enhance times of prayer.

Meditative Prayer

Reprint of a 1901 booklet giving guidance for doing evangelistic work among Southern Blacks.

The Southern Work

Have you ever asked yourself what changed when you were "born again?" You look in the mirror and 
see the same reflection - your body hasn't changed. You find yourself acting the same and yielding 
to those same old temptations - that didn't seem to change either. So you wonder, Has anything 
really changed? The correct answer to that question is foundational for receiving from God. If you lack 
this basic understanding, you'll forever ask yourself doubt-filled questions like: "How could God love 
somebody like me?" and "How can I possibly expect to receive anything from the Lord? I don't deserve 
it, I'm not good enough!" Spirit, Soul, and Body will help you eliminate those and other doubt-filled 
questions that destroy your faith. If you have trouble receiving from God, this is a must-read!

Spirit, Soul, and Body

Educators must both respond to the impact of trauma, and prevent trauma at school. Trauma-informed 
initiatives tend to focus on the challenging behaviors of students and ascribe them to circumstances 
that students are facing outside of school. This approach ignores the reality that inequity itself causes 
trauma, and that schools often heighten inequities when implementing trauma-informed practices that 
are not based in educational equity. In this fresh look at trauma-informed practice, Alex Shevrin Venet 
urges educators to shift equity to the center as they consider policies and professional development. 
Using a framework of six principles for equity-centered trauma-informed education, Venet offers practi-
cal action steps that teachers and school leaders can take from any starting point, using the resources 
and influence at their disposal to make shifts in practice, pedagogy, and policy. Overthrowing inequitable 
systems is a process, not an overnight change. But transformation is possible when educators work 
together, and teachers can do more than they realize from within their own classrooms.

Equity-Centered Trauma-Informed Education (Equity and Social Justice in Education)



"In these essays Pope Francis urges Christians in our time to take up the journey [of walking with 
Jesus] again and to renew their faith. ... [He] does so by drawing from the rich spiritual legacy of St. 
Ignatius of Loyola as well as his pastoral encounters across a long lifetime as a priest, bishop, and now 
pope"--Foreword.

Walking with Jesus

This revised, expanded edition of the Common Worship President’s Edition contains everything to 
celebrate Holy Communion Order One throughout the church year. It combines relevant material 
from the original President’s Edition with Eucharistic material from Times and Seasons, Festivals and 
Pastoral Services, and the Additional Collects.

Common Worship: Times and Seasons President's Edition

The Great Controversy is a work by Ellen G. White, a founder of the Seventh-day Adventist Church, 
considered a prophetess or messenger of God among Seventh-day Adventist members. The book tells 
about the ever-persistent controversy between the good and the bad, represented by the opposition of 
Christ and Satan and the forces of angels that accompany them.

The Great Controversy

With warmth, understanding, and pastoral skill, Fr. Timothy Gallagher provides here a hopeful invitation 
to all who struggle to overcome the greatest obstacle of all in the spiritual life — discouragement. Our 
enemy actively exploits our vulnerabilities, shrewdly leading us time and again into an overwhelming 
sense of disturbance. But Fr. Gallagher pulls the curtain back on the wiles of the devil, offering gentle 
reflections that are remarkably effective in lightening the burdens of your day-to-day spiritual life. You'll 
learn practical ways to find peace amid your spiritual struggles, and patience in the face of even the 
most intense trials. Best of all, you'll learn how to profit spiritually from the afflictions that beset you. 
Each reflection in these pages begins with a quotation by Venerable Bruno Lanteri, the holy founder of 
the Oblates of the Virgin Mary, whose wisdom has guided the uncommonly insightful spirituality of Fr. 
Gallagher. In these pages, y

Overcoming Spiritual Discouragement

Christian education has all but disappeared from the majority of educational systems around the world. 
As governments limit or banish God from among our schools in the name of "separation of church and 
state," we find the very foundation upon which many schools began disintegrating before our eyes. This 
is not a new problem. Over the centuries people have had the same concern of what is true education 
and the place of religion in the educational system. Among these were the newly devoted Christians 
arising from the Great Advent movement sweeping North America during the 18th and 19th century. 
Author Alonzo T. Jones, an important figure in Great Advent movement, felt that Christians should take 
a solid look at the educational systems of that day. Jones believed that true Christian education was the 
only becoming choice to Christians. In The Place of the Bible in Education, he outlines according to the 
Bible what exactly Christian education looks like. He also explores the true meaning of the separation 
between church and state and how Christian education does not fall under such discrimination. In this 
book, he discusses how secular education falls short of even the true meaning of education and how 
this has an adverse affect on our young people. Jones shows how there is a Biblical precedent for true 
education and how the Bible should and can become part of the educational system.

What the Ladybird Heard at the Seaside

Sharing God's Word with children can be the most spiritually satisfying experience of your life. But if 
you've never taught kids before the prospect can be terrifying! Let Elmer Towns put your fears to rest 
as you read through 24 "bite-sized" topics covering everything from motivation to gifting to teaching 
methods! This easy-to-read book will inspire Sunday School teachers - new and experienced - to 
embrace with joy their important role of teaching children of all ages about God's amazing love.

The Place of the Bible in Education

With many scholars and analysts questioning the relevance of deterrence as a valid strategic concept, 
this volume moves beyond Cold War nuclear deterrence to show the many ways in which deterrence 
is applicable to contemporary security. It examines the possibility of applying deterrence theory and 



practice to space, to cyberspace, and against non-state actors. It also examines the role of nuclear 
deterrence in the twenty-first century and reaches surprising conclusions.

The Sanctuary Service

Few studies can be more profitable to Christians today than that of the Epistle to the Hebrews, says 
Richard Phillips. "Written ... to a group of Jewish Christians facing persecution in the mid-first century 
AD, the words of this book speak to Christians everywhere about standing firm in Jesus Christ." 
Hebrews captures the challenges and pitfalls of people throughout the ages and shows both why and 
how to press on in the faith. Its message of warning and hope centers on the surpassing supremacy of 
Jesus, seen often from the vantage point of the Old Testament. In keeping with the Reformed Expository 
Commentary series, this treatment of Hebrews is accessible to both pastors and lay teachers. Each 
volume in the series provides exposition that gives careful attention to the biblical text, is doctrinally 
Reformed, focuses on Christ through the lens of redemptive history, and applies the Bible to our 
contemporary setting. - Publisher.

What Every Sunday School Teacher Should Know

The book of Revelation pronounces a blessing upon everyone who "reads" or even "hears" it read. Yet, 
many treat it as a mysterious book that should not be read and cannot be understood. S. N. Haskell 
has opened the book of Revelation up in an easily read style that explains it and its relation to our day. 
This facsimile, originally printed in 1905, makes an excellent study book for young and old.

Thinking about Deterrence - Enduring Questions in a Time of Rising Powers, Rogue Regimes, and 
Terrorism

In the words of Michael Laitman, "It is beyond human comprehension to understand the essence of 
such spiritual qualities as total altruism and love. This is for the simple reason that human beings 
cannot comprehend how such feelings can exist at all, as everyone seemingly requires an incentive to 
perform any act; without some personal gain, people are not prepared to extend themselves. That is 
why a quality such as altruism can only be imparted to a person from Above, and only those who have 
experienced it can understand it." Attaining The Worlds Beyond is a first step toward discovering the 
ultimate fulfillment of spiritual ascent in our lifetime. This book reaches out to all those who are searching 
for answers, who are seeking a logical and reliable way to understand the world's phenomena. This 
magnificent introduction to the wisdom of Kabbalah provides a new kind of awareness that enlightens 
the mind, invigorates the heart, and moves the reader to the depths of their soul.

Hebrews

This compendium of all the prophecies in Scripture concerns the promised Messiah. Dr. Lockyer's 
discussion is divided into two sections, 'Specific Messianic Prophecies' and 'Symbolic Messianic 
Prophecies.'

The Story of the Seer of Patmos

This compiler design and construction text introduces students to the concepts and issues of compiler 
design, and features a comprehensive, hands-on case study project for constructing an actual, working 
compiler

Attaining the Worlds Beyond

In this stirring follow-up to his memoir, Steve Pemberton gives practical encouragement for how you 
can be a "human lighthouse" for others and through these inspiring stories will renew your hope for 
humanity. Our polarized, divisive culture seems to be without heroes and role models. We are adrift in 
a dark sea of disillusionment and distrust and we need "human lighthouses" to give us hope and direct 
us back to the goodness in each other and in our own hearts. Steve Pemberton found a lighthouse in an 
ordinary man named John Sykes, his former high school counselor. John gave Steve a safe harbor after 
Steve escaped an abusive foster home and together they navigated a new path that led to personal and 
professional success. Through stories of people like John and several others, you will identify how the 
hardships you have overcome equip you to be a "human lighthouse," inspiring those around you. The 
humble gestures of kindness that change the course of our lives can shift the course for America too. 
With a unique vision for building up individuals and communities and restoring trust, The Lighthouse 



Effect opens your eyes to those who are quietly heroic. You will reflect on the lighthouses in your own 
life and be reminded that the greatest heroes are alongside us--and within us.

All the Messianic Prophecies of the Bible

A facsimile reprint of the 1930 edition, containing the often quoted questions and answers regarding 
the change of the solemnity of the seventh-day Sabbath to Sunday.

Compiler Construction

All Praise is due to Allah, the Lord of the Worlds, the [One Who] Sustains the Heavens and Earths, 
Director of all that is created, who sent the Messengers (may the peace and blessings of Allah beupon 
all of them) to rational beings, to guide them and explain the religious laws to them with clearproofs 
and undeniable arguments. I praise Him for all of His bounties. I ask Him to increase HisGrace and 
Generosity. I bear witness that there is none worthy of worship except Allah alone, whohas no partner, 
the One, Who Subdues, the Generous, the Forgiving. I bear witness that our leaderMuhammad is His 
servant and Messenger, His beloved and dear one, the best of all creation. Hewas honoured with the 
Glorious Qur'an that has been an enduring miracle throughout the years.He was also sent with his 
guiding Sunnah that shows the way for those who seek guidance. Ourleader Muhammad has been 
particularised with the characteristic of eloquent and pithy speech, and simplicity and ease in the 
religion. May the peace and blessings of Allah be upon him, theother Prophets and Messengers, all of 
their families and the rest of the righteous.NO Copyrights!!!This book can be printed or reproduced or 
utilized in any form or by anyelectronic, mechanical, or other means, now known or hereafter invented, 
including photocopying and recording, without permission from the publisherfor the sake of spreading 
the True teachings of Isl

The Lighthouse Effect

AQA approved Stretch and challenge your students to achieve their full potential with learning materials 
that guide them through the new content and assessment requirements; developed by subject experts 
with examining experience and one of the leading Geography publishers. - Enables students to learn 
and practise geographical, mathematical and statistical skills through engaging activities specifically 
designed for the reformed 2016 curriculum - Helps higher ability students boost their knowledge and 
understanding via suitably challenging extension tasks that go beyond the core content - Develops 
students' skills responding to a range of questions with topic-specific Question Practice in each section, 
supplemented by practical insight from skilled teachers with examining experience - Incorporates 
possible fieldwork enquiries throughout with unrivalled advice on the changed fieldwork assessment 
from authors specialising in this key area - Reduces your research time by providing a bank of 
contemporary case studies that includes numerous UK examples for the revised criteria

The Convert's Catechism of Catholic Doctrine

Abel Jackson has lived by the sea at Longboat Bay ever since he could remember. He helps his mother 
each day and loves to dive. One day he meets Blueback, the biggest and most beautiful fish he's ever 
seen. When Abel's mother is approached by developers she decides she must do something to protect 
their fragile piece of coastline, But can Abel and his mother save Blueback and Longboat Bay in time? 
An achingly beautiful story about family, belonging and living a life in tune with the environment, from 
one of Australia's best-loved authors.

The Life of the Prophet Muhammad

Expanded and updated from the Electronic Resources section, The APA style guide to electronic 
resources outlines for students and writers the key elements with numerous examples. Dissertations 
and theses; bibliographies; curriculum and course material; reference materials, including Wiki; gray 
literature, such as conference hearings, presentation slides, and policy briefs; general interest media 
and alternative presses such as audio podcasts; and online communities, such as Weblog posts and 
video Weblog posts.

AQA GCSE (9-1) Geography

The report presents the latest assessment of global trends in wildlife crime. It includes discussions on 
illicit rosewood, ivory, rhino horn, pangolin scales, live reptiles, tigers and other big cats, and European 



eel. The COVID-19 (coronavirus) pandemic has highlighted that wildlife crime is a threat not only to the 
environment and biodiversity, but also to human health, economic development and security. Zoonotic 
diseases - those caused by pathogens that spread from animals to humans - represent up to 75% of 
all emerging infectious diseases. Trafficked wild species and the resulting products offered for human 
consumption, by definition, escape any hygiene or sanitary control, and therefore pose even greater 
risks of infection.

Blueback

The first edition of the new Catechism went out across the world in many language versions. This gave 
the local Churches the chance to study it in depth. Through their bishops and teachers they responded 
with comments on texts that needed refinement. The present edition was developed in the light of these 
comments and published in Latin as the definitive Editio Typica. This book is the English translation of 
the Editio Typica.

APA Style Guide to Electronic References

Step by step instruction of the Novus Ordo Mass.

World Wildlife Crime Report 2020

This completely new typeset of the monumental 1957 classic contains an extensive historical and 
theological introduction and detailed notations by George R. Knight, professor of church history at 
Andrews University.; Originally produced by the Ministerial Association of the General Conference of 
SDAs, Questions on Doctrine was widely acclaimed and heavily distributed in the late 1950s and 
early 1960s as a forthright answer to questions from evangelicals about key elements of Adventist 
doctrine. Controversy regarding the book's position on the nature of Christ and the atonment soon 
stopped its circulation.; Intended as a complete reference on the book itself, this new edition faithfully 
reproduces the original text of Questions on Doctrine, with in-text indidcators of the original pagings. 
It includes later important documents that bring the work up to date. The original bibliography is 
followed by an updated selected bibliography. Commentary on various historical or bibliographic topics 
is included in new footnotes throughout the text, all while preserving the reading integrity of the original 
edition.; George Knight's introductory essays provide the background for how the book came about 
and describe the interaction of the principal players involved in the dispute about a small section of 
content that shelved this classic work for more than a generation.; This new edition of Question on 
Doctrine beautifully preserves this outstanding and winsome work of Adventist apologetics to future 
generations of scholars, laypersons, and critics. It is an essential element of every Adventist library.

Catechism Of The Catholic Church Popular Revised Edition

The Seventh Day Sabbath, a Perpetual Sign1847 edition, is a classical and a rare book, that has been 
considered important throughout the human history, and so that this work is never forgotten we at Alpha 
Editions have made efforts in its preservation by republishing this book in a modern format for present 
and future generations. This whole book has been reformatted, retyped and redesigned. These books 
are not made of scanned copies of their original work, and hence their text is clear and readable. This 
remarkable volume falls within the genres of Philosophy, Psychology, Religion Christianity Practical 
theology, Worship

Archaeology and Bible History

General Instruction of the Roman Missal
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