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Hydropower projects, while a crucial source of renewable energy, often come with significant envi-
ronmental impacts and social impacts that demand careful consideration. These hydroelectric power 
effects can include alterations to river ecosystems, biodiversity loss, water quality changes, and the 
displacement of local communities, highlighting the complex dam construction consequences and the 
need for thorough assessment.
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ESIA and SEA for Sustainable Hydropower Development

7 Apr 2021 — Indeed, like any human activity, hydroelectricity is not without impacts on the environment 
and the riparian populations. The great diversity of hydropower projects (Read: Hydropower: diversity 
and specificities) leads to a great variability in the nature and extent of societal and environmental 
impacts ...

The Ecological and Social Impacts of Hydroelectric Dams on the Rio ...

by MM Cernea · 2004 · Cited by 119 — Unless these negative social impacts are preempted by 
governments through explicit policy, legislation, social planning and targeted financing, hydropower 
expansion and overall development in developing countries will be retarded by increasing social 
tensions and growing political and environmental opposition.

Hydroelectric Power - an overview | ScienceDirect Topics

by DM Rosenberg · 1988 · Cited by 243 — in the above quotation, large scale hydroelectric develop-
ment produces a broad range of environmental impacts. Chief among these impacts are landscape 
destruction, contamination of food webs by mercury, and possibly the evolution of greenhouse gases. 
A consid- eration of these impacts follows. peat.
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How Hydroelectric Power Works - Tennessee Valley Authority - TVA

by U Collier · Cited by 15 — Many new hydropower plants currently under construction or planned pose 
a particular threat to the environmental integrity of some of the world's most ecologically diverse river 
basins. This in turn has social impacts such as a decline in important freshwater fisheries. Yet, other 
energy options face their own ...

Facts About Hydropower - Wisconsin Valley Improvement Company

The objective of the questionnaire is to develop a tool whereby the actual effects of hydropower 
development, in terms of real environmental and social impacts, and the efficiency of applied mitigation 
measures can be systematically compared and assessed within a global perspective. Furthermore, 
provided there is an ...

Social Impact | WaterEquity

This evaluation assesses whether ADB is adequately emphasizing the mitigation measures for ad-
verse environmental and social impacts of hydropower projects and to provide recommendations for 
improving their design and implementation. This study recommends ways to improve the design and 
processing of ADB-funded ...

Chapter 4: The social impacts of dams and hydropower in - Elgaronline

16 Mar 2018 — This research study was conducted to review the environmental and social impact of 
mini hydropower plants (run-of-the-river type) by selecting Denawaka Ganga mini hydropower plant, 
which is located in Ratnapura district, Sri Lanka. Field visits and discussions among the authors, 
authorities and the ...

Hydroelectricity: environmental and societal impacts

by H An · 2020 · Cited by 10 — To realize the coordinated and sustainable development of hydropower 
projects and regional society, comprehensively evaluating hydropower projects' influence is critical. 
Usually, hydropower project development has an impact on environmental geology and social and 
regional cultural development.

Social Impacts and Social Risks in Hydropower Programs:

19 Jul 2021 — In this study, we particularly consider those impacts that occur from. HPP operations as 
these particularly alter hydrological and environmental conditions, which thus create social impacts on 
livelihoods of the rural population. ... hydropower projects. Only Richter et al. (2010) approached this ...

Environmental and social impacts of large scale hydro

HYDROPOWER AND THE ENVIRONMENT

Survey of the environmental and social impacts and the ...

Social and Environmental Impacts of Selected Hydropower ...

Environmental and Social Impacts of Mini-hydropower ...

Identify and Assess Hydropower Project's Multidimensional ...

Social Impacts from Hydropower Plants | CALTUS Institute 1
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