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Uncover the mystique of Brennan Marie, a formidable warrior character possessing the elusive power of 
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ability to perfectly mimic others, making her a master of deception and a compelling shapeshifter. 
Explore her story, where identity and battle merge in unpredictable ways.
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Warrior

Two women. One soul. Mirage wasn't supposed to exist. Born from the ritual that gives the witches of 
Starfall their power, she should have been destroyed. Instead she survived, and grew up to become 
one of the most lethal Hunters the land has ever seen. Miryo wasn't supposed to fail. But when her 
initiation at Starfall goes awry, she realizes her double is still alive. Now she must hunt down Mirage 
and put an end to something that should never have begun. But how can a witch kill the perfect warrior, 
when her own magic is trying to kill her?

Doppelganger

Doppelgangers are monsters, hardwired for murder. They are not supposed to have doubts, but this 
one does. He wishes he could be different. More human, maybe. But even that can't stop him from 
killing people so he can take their places and live their lives. He has to do it; it's who he is. But when 
the doppelganger murders a small-town teenager, assumes his shape, and takes over his life, he's 
shocked by the world he steps into. Engulfed in a whirlwind of peer pressure, messy family dynamics, 
and a provocative relationship with a beautiful girl, he quickly learns that there's more than one way 
to be human, and many ways to be a monster. Told in the tortured voice of a most extraordinary teen, 
this contemporary gothic romance brews a captivating combination of violence, desire, and atonement. 
Here is the story of a monster yearning for a human life.

The Doppelganger Omnibus

For centuries, the witches of Starfall have served the people of the fourteen domains while keeping 
their own secrets close. No one outside their ranks knows their power comes from a ritual that divides 
each newborn daughter in two: the witch, infused with magic, and the doppelganger, a soulless shell 
that is soon destroyed. Not all of the doppelgangers are dead, though, and their battle to survive will 
plunge Starfall into crisis. So long as her doppelganger lives, a witch cannot control her magic. But 
there are secrets even the witches do not know, and the doppelgangers hold power of their own . . . 
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This omnibus includes the novels from the novel duology Warrior and Witch, as well as the prequel 
novella “Dancing the Warrior.”

Dancing the Warrior

Those who serve the Warrior face the harshest of discipline. Trained from a young age to become lethal 
Hunters, they have no room in their ranks for the weak -- or for those who join them late. Her entire life, 
Seniade has felt a bond with the Warrior. Becoming a Hunter ought to be a dream come true. But first 
she has to prove herself worthy to stay . . . and she might just kill herself trying. Dancing the Warrior 
is a standalone novella set before the events of the novels Warrior and Witch, by the author of the 
acclaimed Memoirs of Lady Trent series.

Doppelganger

When a witch is born, a doppelganger is created. For a witch to master her powers, the twin must be 
killed. But what happens when the doppelganger survives? This debut is an original adventure fantasy 
about a young witch who must kill her twin in order to survive. Original.

Warrior and Witch

When a witch is born, a doppelganger is created. Forthe witch to master her powers, the twin must be 
killed. Or so itwas believed for centuries . . . Once Mirei discovered that mergingwith a doppelganger 
gave a witch more power than killing them, thewitches at Starfall have been in an uproar (Doppelganger; 
4/06). Herheresy goes against centuries of teaching-and the accepted practice ofmurdering their 
doubles.On a quest to collect the survivingdoppelgangers, Mirei is unsurprised to discover that there 
are stillwitches at Starfall who side against her and her unorthodox ways. Butworse, her fellow hunter 
and closest friend, Eclipse, has beencaptured by these same witches-and has no choice but to swear 
a bloodoath to kill Mirei. If he fails his blood oath, he will die. With thewitches divided, and Starfall itself 
in the middle of a civil war,Mirei will have to choose between saving her friend and figuring out away 
to unite Starfall before it's too late.

Witch

When a witch is born, a doppelganger is created. For the witch to master her powers, the twin must 
be killed. Until now... Created by the merging of witch and doppelganger, Mirei is a unique being. Her 
extraordinary magic makes her the most poweful witch alive -- and a notorious social outcast. While 
Satomi, the leader of the witches' ruling Primes, hails Mirei as a miracle, rival Primes proclaim that Mirei 
is an evil abomination...and that those who champion her must be destroyed. Now the different witch 
factions engage in a bloody war with magic, treachery, and murder. But both sides may be fighting for 
nothing. For the power that the rebel Primes fear, the magic that Mirei alone possesses, is killing her.

A Natural History of Dragons

"You, dear reader, continue at your own risk. It is not for the faint of heart—no more so than the study of 
dragons itself..." From Scirland to the farthest reaches of Eriga, Isabella, Lady Trent is known to be the 
world's preeminent dragon naturalist. She is the remarkable woman who brought the study of dragons 
out of the misty shadows of myth into the clear light of modern science. But before she became the 
illustrious figure we know today, there was a bookish young woman whose passion for learning and 
natural history defied the stifling conventions of her day. Here at last, in her own words, is the true 
story of a pioneering spirit who risked her reputation, her prospects and her fragile flesh to satisfy her 
scientific curiosity; of how she sought true love and happiness despite her lamentable eccentricities; 
and of her thrilling expedition to the perilous mountains of Vystrana, where she made the first of many 
historic discoveries that would change the world forever.

Daughter of Necessity

By day she crafts; by night she unmakes. Surely somewhere, in all the myriad crossings of the threads, 
there is a future in which all will be well. Marie Brennan offers an intriguing new spin on a classic tale. 
At the Publisher's request, this title is being sold without Digital Rights Management Software (DRM) 
applied.

Witch



When a witch is born, a doppelganger is created. For the witch to master her powers, the twin must 
be killed. Until now... Created by the merging of witch and doppelganger, Mirei is a unique being. Her 
extraordinary magic makes her the most powerful witch alive -- and a notorious social outcast. While 
Satomi, the leader of the witches' ruling Primes, hails Mirei as a miracle, rival Primes proclaim that Mirei 
is an evil abomination...and that those who champion her must be destroyed. Now the different witch 
factions engage in a bloody war with magic, treachery, and murder. But both sides may be fighting for 
nothing. For the power that the rebel Primes fear, the magic that Mirei alone possesses, is killing her.

Turning Darkness into Light

A brand-new adventure set in the hugely popular A Natural History of Dragons universe – a delightful 
Victorian-esque fantasy. As the renowned granddaughter of Isabella Camherst (Lady Trent, of the 
riveting and daring Draconic adventure memoirs) Audrey Camherst has always known she, too, would 
want to make her scholarly mark upon a chosen field of study. When Lord Gleinleigh recruits Audrey to 
decipher a series of ancient tablets holding the secrets of the ancient Draconean civilization, she has 
no idea that her research will plunge her into an intricate conspiracy, one meant to incite rebellion and 
invoke war. Alongside dearest childhood friend and fellow archeologist Kudshayn, she must find proof 
of the conspiracy before it's too late.

Voyage of the Basilisk: A Memoir by Lady Trent

Six years after her perilous exploits in Eriga, Isabella embarks on her most ambitious expedition yet: a 
two-year trip around the world to study all manner of dragons in every place they might be found, from 
feathered serpents in the ruins of a fallen civilization to the mighty sea serpents of the tropics. Facing 
storms, shipwrecks, and warfare, she makes a discovery that offers a revolutionary new insight into the 
ancient history of dragons.

The Tropic of Serpents

"During these years I found myself accused of fornication, high treason, and status as the worst 
mother in all of Scirland..." Attentive readers are already familiar with how a bookish young woman 
named Isabella first set out on the historic course that would lead her to becoming the world's premier 
dragon naturalist. Three years after her journey through Vystrana, the illustrious (and occasionally 
scandalous) Lady Trent defies convention to embark on an expedition to the war-torn continent 
of Eriga, home of the legendary swamp-wyrm. Accompanied by an old associate and a runaway 
heiress, Isabella must brave oppressive heat, palace intrigues, gossip, and other hazards in order to 
satisfy her fascination with all things draconian, even if it means venturing deep into the forbidden 
jungle known as the Green Hell... where her courage, resourcefulness, and scientific curiosity will be 
tested as never before. "[U]ncompromisingly honest and forthright... with a heroine at once admirable, 
formidable and captivating. Reader, lose no time in making Isabella's acquaintance." Kirkus (starred 
review) "Marie Brennan brings dragons into the Victorian world, and flawlessly so... [It] gives fantasy 
readers another good reason to enter Brennan's fantastical world." Washington Post "Every bit as 
exciting and engrossing as the first part of Lady Trent's memoir. Isabella's strength and bravery in the 
name of scientific advancement... is beyond admirable—she's a model protagonist." RT book reviews 
"Lady Trent makes for an intrepid and pleasingly independent protagonist, mastering challenges both 
emotional and physical." Publishers Weekly

Within the Sanctuary of Wings

After her adventure in the mountains of Vystrana, and her exploits in the depths of Eriga, to the high 
seas aboard The Basilisk, and then to the deserts of Akhia, the Lady Trent has captivated hearts 
along with fierce minds. This concluding volume will finally reveal the truths behind her most notorious 
adventure - scaling the tallest peak in the world, behind the territory of Scirland's enemies - and what 
she discovered there, within the Sanctuary of Wings.

Driftwood

Who is Last? Fame is rare in Driftwood--it's hard to get famous if you don't stick around long enough for 
people to know you. But many know the guide, Last, a one-blooded survivor who has seen his world end 
many lifetimes ago. For Driftwood is a strange place of slow apocalypses, where continents eventually 
crumble into mere neighborhoods, pulled inexorably towards the center in the Crush. Cultures clash, 



countries fall, and everything eventually disintegrates. Within the Shreds, a rumor goes around that Last 
has died. Drifters come together to commemorate him. But who really was Last? Lying liar, or heroic 
savior? A mercenary, a charlatan, a legend? A man, an immortal--perhaps even a god? Discover Marie 
Brennan (The Memoirs of Lady Trent)'s incomparable Driftwood, a realm of fragments cohered into a 
myth that encompasses realities.

The Rise of the Wyrm Lord

The second exciting adventure in The Door Within trilogy awaits! The Rise of the Wyrm Lord revisits 
favorite characters from The Door Within and opens with Aidan Thomas in trouble. Separated from 
his best friend by a thousand miles and unable to return to The Realm of Glimpses himself, Aidan 
needs a way to reach Robby with a message from King Eliam, the one true King. Enter Antoinette 
Reed, a bright but headstrong young woman who seems like the perfect person to reach King Eliam. 
When Aidan discovers that Antoinette has been called to enter The Realm, he solicits her help to find 
Robby's Glimpse before it is too late. But when she arrives in the Kingdom of Alleble, Antoinette finds 
the kingdom is in turmoil. Alleble's allies are inexplicably beginning to turn away, renouncing former ties 
with King Eliam. And there are rumors that the dark Prince of Paragory, sworn enemy of the Kingdom, 
is seeking an ancient evil power—the Wyrm Lord—to crush the Alleble once and for all. With over 
250,000 copies sold in The Door Within trilogy, this is a perfect time to introduce the series to a new 
tween audience The fantasy genre is wildly popular among young readers, and The Rise of the Wyrm 
Lord is a heart-pounding second installment that will leave tweens and teens on the edge of their seats. 
Meets national education standards.

In Ashes Lie

ABOVE It is the seventeenth century. For twenty years, the City of London has been torn apart: by war, 
by plague, by fire. BELOW The Onyx Court is London's faerie shadow. Dedicated to co-existence with 
mortals, it struggles to survive against rival courts who oppose everything it stands for. BETWEEN 
Now, when these two realms are at their most divided, they face a threat neither can defeat alone. The 
Great Fire ravaging London is more than mere flames. While the city's human residents struggle to halt 
the inexorable blaze, the fae must defeat a stranger foe: the embodiment of the fire itself, a monstrous 
Dragon that seeks to devour London both above and below. If the faerie queen Lune and her mortal 
consort cannot bring the two worlds together, the city itself may not survive . . . .

The Monstrous-Feminine

In almost all critical writings on the horror film, woman is conceptualised only as victim. In The 
Monstrous-Feminine Barbara Creed challenges this patriarchal view by arguing that the prototype of 
all definitions of the monstrous is the female reproductive body.With close reference to a number of 
classic horror films including the Alien trilogy, T

Spaces of Identity

We are living through a time when old identities - nation, culture and gender are melting down. Spaces 
of Identity examines the ways in which collective cultural identities are being reshaped under conditions 
of a post-modern geography and a communications environment of cable and satellite broadcasting. 
To address current problems of identity, the authors look at contemporary politics between Europe and 
its most significant others: America; Islam and the Orient. They show that it's against these places that 
Europe's own identity has been and is now being defined. A stimulating account of the complex and 
contradictory nature of contemporary cultural identities.

Spiraling (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 6)

This is the 6th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Marie Brennan. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of 
Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 



upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Dualed

The Hunger Games meets Matched in this high-concept thriller where citizens must prove their worth 
by defeating the other version of themselves—their twin. Two of you exist. Only one will survive. West 
Grayer is ready. She's trained for years to confront her Alternate, a twin raised by another family. Survival 
means a good job, marriage—life. But then a tragic misstep leaves West questioning: Is she the best 
version of herself, the version worthy of a future? If she is to have any chance of winning, she must 
stop running not only from herself, but also from love . . . though both have the power to destroy her. 
Fast-paced and unpredictable, Elsie Chapman's suspenseful YA debut weaves unexpected romance 
into a chilling, unforgettable world. Praise for Dualed: "A gripping, thought-provoking thriller that keeps 
your heart racing and your palms sweaty. . . . The kind of book Katniss Everdeen and Jason Bourne 
would devour." —Andrew Fukuda, author of the Hunt series "Full of unexpected turns. . . . Fans of the 
Divergent trilogy will want to read this imaginative tale." —VOYA "A fast ride from first to final pages, 
Dualed combines action and heart." —Mindy McGinnis, author of Not a Drop to Drink "Intense and 
swift, Dualed grabbed me by the throat and kept me turning pages all the way to the end. Romance and 
action fans alike will love it." —Elana Johnson, author of the Possession series "Stylish, frenetic, and 
violent, . . . the textual equivalent of a Quentin Tarantino movie."—Publishers Weekly "A double dose of 
intensity and danger in this riveting tale of survival, heartache, and love."—Kasie West, author of Pivot 
Point "This thought-provoking survival-of-the-fittest story will leave you breathless for more." —Ellen 
Oh, author of Prophecy "Clever suspense—here, stalking is a two-way street." —Kirkus Reviews

Emotion, Place and Culture

Recent years have witnessed a rapid rise in engagement with emotion and affect across a broad 
range of disciplines in the humanities and social sciences, with geographers among others making a 
significant contribution by examining the emotional intersections between people and places. Building 
on the achievements of Emotional Geographies (2005), the editors have brought together leading 
scholars such as Nigel Thrift, Alphonso Lingis and Frances Dyson as well as young, up and coming 
academics from a diverse range of disciplines to investigate feelings and affect in various spatial and 
social contexts, environments and landscapes. The book is divided into five sections covering the 
themes of remembering, understanding, mourning, belonging, and enchanting.

Un Lun Dun

The iron wheel began to spin, slowly at first, then faster and faster. The room grew darker. As the light 
lessened, so did the sound. Deeba and Zanna stared at each other in wonder. The noise of the cars 
and vans and motorbikes outside grew tinny . . . The wheel turned off all the cars and turned off all 
the lamps. It was turning off London. Zanna and Deeba are two girls leading ordinary lives, until they 
stumble into the world of UnLondon, an urban Wonderland where all the lost and broken things of 
London end up . . . and some of its lost and broken people too. Here discarded umbrellas stalk with 
spidery menace, carnivorous giraffes roam the streets, and a jungle sprawls beyond the door of an 
ordinary house. UnLondon is under siege by the sinister Smog and its stink-junkie slaves; it is a city 
awaiting its hero. Guided by a magic book that can’t quite get its facts straight, and pursued by Hemi 
the half-ghost boy, the girls set out to stop the poisonous cloud before it burns everything in its path. 
They are joined in their quest by a motley band of UnLondon locals, including Brokkenbroll, boss of the 
broken umbrellas, Obaday Fing, a couturier whose head is an enormous pincushion, and an empty 
milk carton called Curdle. Winner of the Locus Award for Best Young Adult Book, China Miéville’s Un 
Lun Dun is an extraordinary vivid creation;is populated by astonishing frights and delights that will thrill 
the imagination.

Mad Maudlin

For to see mad Tom o'Bedlam, ten thousand miles she's traveled. At the Publisher's request, this title 
is being sold without Digital Rights Management Software (DRM) applied.

Ashes of a Black Frost



"Bones jutted from the sand at angles--not odd angles, though, for that would suggest that there 
were ways bones could protrude that made sense--and the eyes of those still living stared and saw 
nothing. Amidst a scene of carnage on a desert battlefield blanketed in metallic snow, Major Konowa 
Swift Dragon sees his future, and it is one drenched in shadow and blood. Never mind that he has 
won a grand victory for the Calahrian Empire. He came here in search of his lost regiment of elves, 
while the Imperial Prince came looking for the treasures of a mystical library, and both ventures 
have failed. But Konowa knows, as do the Iron Elves--both living and dead--that another, far more 
important battle now looms before them. The campaign in the desert was only the latest obstacle on 
the twisted, darkening path leading inexorably to the Hyntaland, and the final confrontation with the 
dreaded Shadow Monarch"--Publisher description.

New Germans, New Dutch

In today’s globalized world, traditions of a national Self and a national Other no longer hold. This 
timely volume considers the stakes in our changing definitions of national boundaries in light of the 
unmistakable transformation of German and Dutch societies. Examining how the literature of migration 
intervenes in public discourses on multiculturality and including detailed analysis of works by the 
Turkish-German writers Emine Sevgi Özdamer and Feridun Zaimoglu and the Moroccan-Dutch writers 
Abdelkader Benali and Hafid Bouazza, New Germans, New Dutch offers crucial insights into the ways 
in which literature negotiates both difference and the national context of its writing.

Shattered Blades (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 10)

This is the 10th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Marie Brennan. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of 
Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Baby Shower (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 3)

This is the 3rd episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Cassandra Khaw. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of 
Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

The Gauntlet (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 4)

This is the 4th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Michael R. Underwood. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands 
of Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Born to the Blade: A Novel

For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the 
sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, magical duels. But the Circle's ability to 



maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for conquest and the trade nation of Quloo 
is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries 
to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her 
conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they upset the balance of power. The storm they 
bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear them apart. Named one of Den of Geek's Best 
Fiction Books of 2018 Praise for Born to the Blade: “...probably the coolest martial arts magic series 
in any genre since the original Avatar: The Last Airbender came out.” —Den of Geek contributor Alana 
Joli Abbott

Mother of Learning: ARC 1

Zorian Kazinski has all the time in the world to get stronger, and he plans on taking full advantage of it. 
A teenage mage of humble birth and slightly above-average skill, Zorian is attending his third year of 
education at Cyoria's magical academy. A driven and quiet young man, he is consumed by a desire to 
ensure his own future and free himself of the influence of his family, resenting the Kazinskis for favoring 
his brothers over him. Consequently, Zorian has no time for pointless distractions, much less other 
people's problems. As it happens, though, time is something he is about to get plenty of. On the eve of 
Cyoria's annual summer festival, Zorian is murdered, then abruptly brought back to the beginning of 
the month, just before he was about to take the train to school. Finding himself trapped in a time loop 
with no clear end or exit, he will have to look both within and without to unravel the mystery set before 
him. He does have to unravel it, too, because the loop clearly wasn’t made for his sake, and in a world 
of magic even a time traveler isn't safe from those who wish him ill. Fortunately for Zorian, repetition is 
the mother of learning…

The Poltergeist Prince of London

It began with a key. One afternoon in 1956, in the home of the Hitchings family in Battersea, south 
London, a small silver key appeared on Shirley Hitchings' bed. This seemingly insignificant event 
heralded the beginning of one of the most terrifying, incredible and mysterious hauntings in British 
history. The spirit, who quickly became known as 'Donald', began to communicate, initially via tapping 
sounds, but over time - and with the encouragement of psychical researcher Harold Chibbett, whose 
case-files appear here – by learning to write. Soon, the spirit had begun to make simply incredible 
claims about his identity, insisting that he was one of the most famous figures in world history – but 
what was the truth? Here, for the first time, is the full story, told by the woman right at the heart of it all 
– Shirley herself.

Arrivals (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 1)

This is the 1st episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Michael R. Underwood. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands 
of Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Dreadnought (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 7)

This is the 7th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Cassandra Khaw. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of 
Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Hollywood Genres: Formulas, Filmmaking, and The Studio System



The central thesis of this book is that a genre approach provides the most effective means for 
understanding, analyzing and appreciating the Hollywood cinema. Taking into account not only the 
formal and aesthetic aspects of feature filmmaking, but various other cultural aspects as well, the genre 
approach treats movie production as a dynamic process of exchange between the film industry and 
its audience. This process, embodied by the Hollywood studio system, has been sustained primarily 
through genres, those popular narrative formulas like the Western, musical and gangster film, which 
have dominated the screen arts throughout this century.

Assassination (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 9)

This is the 9th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. This 
episode written by Malka Older. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of Twaa-Fei 
has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, magical 
duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for conquest 
and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and island 
a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial subject 
Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they upset the 
balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear them apart.

All the Nations of the Sky (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 11)

This is the 11th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Michael R. Underwood. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands 
of Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Fault Lines (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 2)

This is the 2nd episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. 
This episode written by Marie Brennan. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of 
Twaa-Fei has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, 
magical duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for 
conquest and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and 
island a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial 
subject Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they 
upset the balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear 
them apart.

Doppelganger

As a member of a shape-changing race of monsters, an insecure doppelganger takes over the life of 
a popular high school athlete and ends up deeply involved in the youth's challenging and troubled life 
in the process.

Refugees (Born to the Blade Season 1 Episode 8)

This is the 8th episode in the first season of Born to the Blade, an 11-episode serial from Serial Box. This 
episode written by Malka Older. For centuries the Warders' Circle on the neutral islands of Twaa-Fei 
has given the countries of the sky a way to avoid war, settling their disputes through formal, magical 
duels. But the Circle's ability to maintain peace is fading: the Mertikan Empire is preparing for conquest 
and the trade nation of Quloo is sinking, stripped of the aerstone that keeps both ships and island 
a-sky. When upstart Kris Denn tries to win their island a seat in the Warder’s Circle and colonial subject 
Oda no Michiko discovers that her conquered nation's past is not what she's been told, they upset the 
balance of power. The storm they bring will bind all the peoples of the sky together...or tear them apart.



https://chilis.com.pe | Page 9 of 9


